
191

REPUBLIC OF FIJI GOVERNMENT GAZETTE SUPPLEMENT

2012TUESDAY, 12th JUNENo. 24

EXTRAORDINARY

[LEGAL NOTICE NO. 54]

FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT ACT 2004
_____

Procurement (Amendment) Regulations 2012 
IN exercise of the powers conferred upon me by section 81 of the Financial Management 
Act 2004 I hereby make the following Regulations—

Short title and commencement
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Procurement (Amendment) Regulations 

2012, and shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Gazette. 

(2)  The Procurement Regulations 2010 shall be referred to as the “Principal 
Regulations”. 

Regulation 9 amended

2.  Regulation 9(2) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$30,001” 
and substituting with “$50,001”.

Regulation 27 amended

3.  Regulation 27(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting “$30,000” 
and substituting with “$50,000” and deleting “$30,001” and substituting with “$50,001”.

Regulation 29 amended
4.  Regulation 29 of the Principal Regulations is amended—

(a) in sub-regulation (1) by deleting “$100” and substituting with “$1000” and 
deleting “$30,000” and substituting with “$50,000”; 

(b) in sub-regulation (2) by deleting “$100” and substituting with “$1000”; and
(c) by inserting the following new sub-regulation after sub-regulation (2)—

“(3)  A Permanent Secretary or Head of Department may waive the  
 requirement to obtain competitive quotes for the procurement of  
 goods, services or works below the value of $50,000 where-

(i) there is only one supplier capable of supplying the goods, 
services or works in Fiji;

(ii) there is a binding annual contract with the supplier; 
(iii) a supplier has been nominated by an aid agency which is 

funding at least 50% of the procurement; or
(iv) it is for the expeditious supply of specialised, technical 

services from a supplier who has previously provided services 
to Government and has through that engagement created or 
used its intellectual property or working knowledge to deliver 
the services procured.



192

Regulation 30 amended

5. Regulation 30(1) of the Principal Regulations is amended by deleting  “$30,001” 
and substituting with “$50,001”.

Dated this 12th day of June 2012.

A. SAYED-KHAIYUM
Attorney-General & Acting Minister of Finance

Price: 50c A. NAIVAKASORO, Government Printer, Suva, Fiji – 2012 108/FGGS/2012—900 
Official Printer Since 1883


